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Seattle is building a network of 
neighborhood greenways, protected bike 
lanes, and trails that work together with 
funding for bike parking, encouragement 
programs, and safety education, to make 
biking a healthy, affordable travel option 
for people of all ages and abilities. 

As part of this work, we have been 
installing a Neighborhood Greenway on 
21st Ave S, between S Columbia St and 
Washington Middle School. Previous 
work updated curb ramps and marked 
crosswalks at E Yesler Way, E Jefferson 
St, and E Cherry St, and paved sections of 
21st Ave S.

In the coming weeks, we will update curb 
ramps at 21st and E Alder st, and at 21st 
and E Terrace St. Later this year, we will 
pave between E James St and E Spruce 
St. We will also add speed humps and 
new signage in some areas.

 

INFORMATION & CONTACT
Summer Jawson 
206-684-8264 | neighborhoodgreenways@seattle.gov
www.seattle.gov/transportation/projects-and-programs/
programs/greenways-program
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